From: 1 C < 3@gmail.com>

Sent: 23 December 2022 11:38
To: info
Subject: Claim FSCS Ref PB22-

Dear Ms Brooksby

| write with reference to your letter of 21st November. It is very remiss of me not to have responded before now. At
that time, my wife underwent an operation and has since been at home recovering so it rather slipped my mind.

I am very grateful for all your efforts in obtaining this compensation which has come at an opportune time, just before
Christmas. | must admit, | was somewhat sceptical as to whether the claim would succeed after all this time so it was a
very pleasant surprise.

| have to say that your colleagues have kept me updated throughout the time and your fee is well deserved.

With thanks

JTC



From: james gmail.com>
Sent: 09 September 2022 19:30

To: @hallbrookpartners.co.uk>

Subject: Claim against Catalyst

Edward,

| hope you have enjoyed a good weekend ?

Just wanted to drop a quick note to thank you and your team for handling the successful claim against the FSA. You
deserve full marks for perseverance !! and for keeping me so well informed as the claim has progressed.

All very much appreciated.
Very many thanks
Regards

James



From: Al B <e @gmail.com>

Sent: 03 November 2022 13:46
To: info
Subject: Compensation - Catalyst Investment Group Limited

Good afternoon
Firstly, | must thank you for being successful with my claim against Catalyst.

The fact that you did not give up when the claim was rejected shows to me the tenacious attitude which is sadly lacking
in many organisations today.

The compensation will make a huge difference to me especially with all the cost of living increases we are all suffering
right now.

You mention in your letter that you can make payment by Direct Bank Transfer and given that we are subject to Postal
Strikes, | would be grateful if you could make the payment to me by this method.

My Bank details are: Sort Code:

Once again thank you for all your help.
Best Regards,

Alan



From: C A <g! @gmail.com>

Sent: 14 December 2022 19:51
To: info
Subject: Compensation pb22-

Hi there. | have received my cheque from your good selves. Would just like to thank you all for dealing with my claim so
efficiently and quickly. Have a great Christmas and enjoy the well earned rest you deserve. Take Care. Graeme. 4
Sent from my iPhone



From: W C <W @gmail.com>

Sent: 07 October 2022 13:11
To: info
Subject: Compensation received re Catalyst Investment Group Ltd Claim

FAO Ewan Porter

Dear Ewan

Just received a bank transfer re Catalyst Investment Group Ltd. Also received a letter from FSCS. Many thanks. | want
to place on record my appreciation of your handling of this claim from start to finish. | have to say | thought you had a
10-20% chance at best. However it was all professionally and very well handled.

So that's two successful claims - well done and thank you very much to all you were involved.

Regards

Will C



From: o 1 <d @gmail.com>

Sent: 28 January 2023 12:18
To: info
Subject: DMT Ltd

Dear sir / Madam
FSCS Reference PB22-
Congratulations on getting my investment back in compensation from DMT
| am just wondering whether you requested the compound interest that would have accrued from the investment
over the almost 9 years as a fair completion of compensation
It is good that you have got an added £81.40 but | am just thinking that the interest would add more.
Keep up the good work
Thanking you
Kindest regards
David T



From: Mike W < @btinternet.com>

Pl

Sent: 07 February 2023 11:41
To: info
Subject: FAO Claire Brooksby

FSCS Reference: PB22-
Dear Claire,

Thank you for your letters of 30 Jan and 1 Feb, and for the bank transfer which arrived before the letters. | confirm
receipt of the payment of £2,345.45, also | have subsequently received the formal letter from FSCS.

Please pass on my personal thanks to Edward and your other colleagues who have worked tirelessly on this complex
case and finally achieved a positive outcome.

Best Regards,
Mike W

DriMA

Rowington
Warwick CV35
UK

Sent from Mail for Windows



From: Tony K <T @outlook.com>

Sent: 06 September 2022 09:55
To: info
Subject: FSCS ref: PB22-

Dear Clair Brooksby

This is to thank you for yours of 1% September informing me of the successful FSCS claim
against Catalyst Investment Group. | should like to express my appreciation of Holbrook's
work on this matter and its satisfactory outcome. | have been particularly impressed by the
diligence with which your officers have kept me informed of progress on this long-drawn-out
matter. | am glad | turned to Holbrook.

Best wishes.

Tony



From: Christopher <ch @icloud.com>

Sent: 01 January 2023 17:52

To: info

Subject: FSCS Ref: PB22- Claire Brooksby
Dear Claire

Many thanks for your letter dated 7 December 2022, enclosing a cheque for £1504.93. This arrived with the post
Christmas mail and has now been credited to my account.

I am grateful for the clear and efficient way in which your partnership handled my claim. | admit that initially | was very
sceptical about the likelihood of a satisfactory outcome but your persistence has paid off.

Wishing you a happy New Year

Chris



From: Terry < @talktalk.net>

Sent: 31 January 2023 14:20
To: info
Subject: FSCS ref PB22-

Thank you the £733.25 it is now in the bank, did you get any further with the claim against CSS partners etc.?
Best Regards
Terry



From: michael @gmail.com>

Sent: 04 May 2022 11:33
To: info
Subject: FSCS Reference PB22-

Dear Claire Brooksby,

Thank you for your letter of 29th April 2022 notifying me formally of my successful claim regarding Beaufort Securities
Limited.

I am not sure whether you have my bank details to enable you to make any payments to me using BACS. They are:

Please let me know when any transfer has been made.

I would like to thank you and the personnel at Hallbrooks for the professional way in which you have handled my claims.
Your efficient and effective approach is very much appreciated.

If you experience any potential clients who are doubtful about using your services, then | am very happy for you to
quote me as someone who is well satisfied with the service | have received from your company.

Michael



From: Gary @gmail.com>

Sent: 09 March 2023 09:35
To: info

Subject: FSCS Reference: PB22-
Dear Claire

Thank you for your letter of 10 February and the payment received in respect of Eastern European Ventures and Double
Carbon Battery for which | am most grateful.

Are these the end of your actions or are there ongoing claims re the other Catalyst Investment Group investments in
Ashton Penney, Ubet2Win, and Europol?

Kind regards

Gary



From: Chris @outlook.com>

Sent: 03 March 2023 12:30
To: info
Subject: FSCS Reference: PB22-

Thanks to all the team for sorting my claim out it is much appreciated in these hard times.

Chris

Sent from my Galaxy



From: Hotmail @hotmail.com>
Sent: 30 November 2022 06:51
To: @hallbrookpartners.co.uk>

Subject: DMT and CIA
Good morning Ewan,

Just wanted to extend another heartfelt thank you as | noticed an additional GBP 11 514 had been transfered into my
account.

As before, there is a huge amount of relief in dissolving the frustrations of this experience with DMT and the efforts from
you and your team have been pivotal in reaching this closure. | am sure you have helped many others in a similar

situation and | have no doubt my gratitude can almost certainly be extended on their behalf as well.

Once again, thank you very very much - and may | also wish you and your team a very pleasant Christmas and Happy
new Year!

Best Regards
Garth

Sent from my iPad



From: jim @gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, October 3, 2022 3:05:35 PM
To: @hallbrookpartners.co.uk>
Subject: Pension compensation

Dear Charlotte,

Just to say we have received our compensation in full, we will never be able to thank you for all your
hard work, considering the awful last couple of years we have had ,The kindness and understanding you have shown
has made you a very special person and in this day and age people like you and Ashley are hard to come by, I've been
pretty down and still in pain but the way you all treated me was 5 thank you for being so compassionate.

Kind Regards
James and kim



From: Paul @hotmail.co.uk>

Sent: 02 February 2023 23:55
To: info

Subject: Re Pello Capital

Hi,

Many thanks for your email re Pello Capital.
Whilst we were contacted by one of the former members of staff of DMT we took the decision NOT to trust
anyone associated directly or indirectly with DMT with any further investments, so on this occasion we were

not exposed to any dealings that might have resulted in a loss.

We would again like to thank you for acting for us previously and would have no hesitation in recommending
you to anyone else who finds themselves in a similar situation

Kind regards

Paul Al



From: Garry @outlook.com>

Sent: 05 October 2022 15:33

To: @hallbrookpartners.co.uk>

Subject: RE: Your claim against Catalyst Investment Group Limited
Dear Charlotte,

Letter received from Claire Brooksby, thank you.

This is just to confirm that the net compensation has been received into my bank account. Thank you for all the work,
and the prompt bank transfer.

Kind regards

Garry



From: linda gmail.com>

Sent: 11 December 2022 14:42
To: info
Subject: Ref PB22 -

Just to say Thanks very much for your letter and cash - a very nice surprise for Christmas.

Linda
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